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One of the key components of WP2- Mapping and identification of the most sought-
after and relevant competencies for aspiring solo entrepreneurs and self-
employment is the Learning Outcomes EntreComp-based Matrix. This matrix is an
official deliverable outlined in the Work Package plan. Its purpose is to assist partners
and the project targets in better understanding the specific needs addressed by the
project, as well as the training areas emphasized in the curriculum and training offers
of SELF. The matrix, indeed, links and bridges the training needs identified by the
partners at the level of skills, knowledge, and attitudes for aspiring young solo
entrepreneurs, with the related EntreComp competence that is best positioned to
cover and intervene on that need.

After completing the literature review and writing the country report, partners have
been asked to identify the most urgent training and education needs for aspiring
young solo entrepreneurs based on their assessment. Then, they identified which of
the EntreComp competencies, within any of the three training areas, offers the most
cohesive and consistent pedagogical response. In other words, they pinpointed the
competence that appears to address the identified skill/knowledge gap most
effectively.

The actual compiling of the matrix done by EDUCatt as the lead organization of
WP2, considering the inputs from partners provides for a concise and comprehensive
list of training needs and skills gaps, and the corresponding competence from
EntreComp that works best to address them.

The Desk Research conducted through the country reports confirms that there is a
necessity for training and soft skills improvement demanded by the market.
Identifying competence gaps in young self-entrepreneurs and addressing them
through targeted training and courses is paramount. Below are the significant skills
useful for developing the next phases of the SELF Project, i.e. WP3 -Development of
solo-entrepreneurship curricula, tools, training, and resources for self-employment
and WP4- Build and set up of the project’s eLearning digital warehouse and test &
validation in pilot version (T&V) of the training resources to a cohort of 200 targets.
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Training Areas and Competences 
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INTO ACTION


